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Public Inquiries Staff

THE KINZUA DAM, THE SENECA NATION, AND THE UNITED STATES

Historical Background

Kinzua Dam, located on the Allegheny River in southwestern New York on lands
held since 1794 by the Seneca Indian Nation, is now under construction by
the U. S. Army Corps of Engineers and nearing completion. Authorization for
its construction is contained in 1938 legislation authorizing the Ohio River
Basin flood control project. Funds were made available for its construction
in the Public Works Appropriation Act of 1958.

The lands to be flooded, permanently or intermittently, include approximately
10,200 acres in Cattaraugus County on the Allegany Reservation, one of three
reservations of the Senecas. These 10,000 acres are about one-third of the
entire acreage within the Allegany Reservation. According to the Corps of
Engineers, approximately 5,000 acres of Seneca land within the taking area
will be available for use by the Indians for farming, grazing, hunting, and
other similar purposes, but not for habitation.

The Seneca Nation has 4,132 enrolled members, of whom about 1,100 reside on
the Allegany Reservation. Of these latter, 482 (making up 127 families) are
within the reservoir area.

The Seneca Nation contested in the courts the authority of the Corps of
Engineers to condemn land for and to construct the project. They held that
the Pickering Treaty of 1794, which reserved the aforementioned lands to
the Senecas, had been violated in that the treaty provided that "the United
States will never claim the same, nor disturb the Seneca Nation ... in
their free use and enjoyment thereof.'

However, the treaty also provides that the land shall remain in the possession
of the Senecas "until they choose to sell the same to the people of the United
States, who have the right to purchase.

The Senecas lost their suits, the Courts deciding that Congress had authorized
the taking of the lands. (However, in the opinion handed down by the U. S.
Court of Appeals, District of Columbia Circuit, the issue of moral responsi-
bility of the Senecas was raised.)

Public sentiment led to President Kennedy's direct communication with the
Seneca Nation.



He said: "I have directed the departments and agencies of the Federal
Government to take every action within their authority to
assist the Seneca Nation and its members who must be relo-
cated to adjust to the new situation .... I hope you will
convey to the members of the Seneca Nation the desire of
the Federal Government to assist them in every proper way
to make the adjustment as fair and orderly as possible. I
pledge you our cooperation.”

The Bureau of Indian Affairs in April, 1962, reopened its office at

Salamanca (closed since 1949 following assumption by the State of New
York of responsibility for law enforcement on Seneca lands).

Congressional Action 1963-64

January 14, 1964 - H, R. 1794 introduced by Mr. Haley of Florida to
compensate the Senecas, and providing for payment for the land taken;
funds for indirect damages; and funds for a general rehabilitation and

relocation program.

July 9, 1963 - S. 1836 introduced by Sen. Javits of New York to compensate
the Senecas.

February 7, 1964 - H. R. 1794 passed the House.

The Senate then opened hearings on H. R. 1794 as it had passed the House,
and on March 30, 1964, passed an amended version of H. R. 1794 and

S. 1836. The principal differences in Senate and House versions appeared in
Section 4 relating to the amount of funds provided for rehabilitation.

While H. R. 1794 provided for nearly $17 million for rehabilitation, in
addition to $3 million for direct and indirect damages, the Senate version
would have cut back the rehabilitation funds to $6 millionm.

A conference committee was appointed which reached agreement on a total
settlement of approximately $15 million, more than $12 million of which
would be allocated for rehabilitation purposes and the remainder for direct
and indirect damages.

The measure as it came out of the conference committee was passed by both
Houses and on August 31, 1964, became law with the President's signature.

The Situation at Present

Attached is a report (January 11, 1965) by the Seneca President on the
State of the Seneca Nation.

February 1965



UNITED-STATES

FORM 5-114 , DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
....................................... BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS ____ .
ISSUED BY: Superintendent { INVITATION NO..1=f4.... BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED
Yak#ma Indian Agency UNTIL AND OPENED AT........2.200..-yMey v LOCAL TIME

Toppenish, Washington
DATE: March 4, 1964

,AT...Yakima
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Sealed bids in duplicate, subject to the terms and conditions of this invitation, its schedule and stipulated provisions, will be received
at the above office until above designated time and at that time publicly opened. All bids are subject to acceptance and approval by the
Area Director. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to disapprove any transaction at any time prior to final approval of a
deed or issuance of a fee patent, in accordance with 25 CFR 121. Bids on Indian land olfered for sale must be accompanied by a cashier’s

check, certified check, postal money order, or United States Treasurer’s check payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs for not less than
10% of the total offer made.

General information and instructions to bidders are contained in the Instructions to Bidders, Terms and Conditions of the Invitation for

Bids, which is a part hereol. For detailed information call or write. SUperintendent e..Yakima Indian-Agency: e
P..0..Box.632, Toppenish,. Washington + Phone No..T...5=6505.
SCHEDULE OF BIDS
------- ---—-----—--.----o------—---.----..-------------------------__---_----------—--------—---...a-.._....---~--
Item Allotment No. of { Amountof | Item {  Allotment No. of Amount of
No. Number Acres Bid i No. Number Acres Bid

..............................................................................................................
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from date of receipt of notice of award deposit with the issuing officer, Bureau of Indian Affairs, the full amount of his offer, with stipulated

sales fees, and that failure to make such deposit within the specified time will constitute a forfeiture of 10% of the amount offered-on each
such item.

E Signature of Bidder

:

: Name of Bidder (Print or Type)

:

)

E Address (Print or Type)

e NOTICE OF AWARD IO SUGCESSFULBIDDER 777" ===

You are hereby notified that you are the successtul'bidder on the following items:
Balance of the purchase price in the amount of § shall be remitted to the above

issuing office not later than:

Date

REMITTANCE SHOULD BE MADE
BY CASHIER'S CHECK, CERTI-
FIED CHECK, POSTAL MONEY
ORDER, OR UNITED STATES
TREASURER'S CHECK , made Area Director

payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

£

i e o e o iy
"SALES FEES ARE AS FOLLOWS:

TRIBAL PURCHASE PRICE

420,00 $1000 or less
25.00 1000 to 2000
30.00 2000 to 3000
40,00 3000 ta 4000
50.00 4000 to 5000
63.00 5000 to 7500

75.00 7500 and over

——
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REVERSE OF FOR! 5=114 INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
JANUARY 1960 TERMS AMD COMDITICNS OF THE INVITATION FCR BIDS

I, JARKING AtD MAILING BILS « Bids, with thoir gurrcatics, must bo sccurcly scaled in suitable ervolopes, ad-
drezsod to the 1ssuirg ofiice and marked on tho outside with the invitation ru=bor and date of opening, both of
wulch may be found in the block opposite the rems of the icsuing office on the fromt of this forn.
2. PREPANATICH OF BIDS = Unless oihortiso directed in the invitetion, bids shall bo submitted in duplicates
Porpo turnlstod, or coploes thoreof, chall be uscd, and sirlet oomplicnce Wth the requirczsnts of ths invitatlons,
and thezo instruotions, is ncceszerys. Speoiel caro chould bo oxerciccd in ths Preparatlion and cubnaission of bids
%o asture full corplience with thoe invitction arnd instructicnz. Al itom ruzbors ard prices ghall be fully ard
olearly sot forthe Coples of the bid shall be identicals Tko propor blank gpaces in the bid ghall bo suiichly
filled ine
3e SIGHATUGT 70 BIDS - Eash bid rust givo addross of ths biddor and bo signed by hin with his usual sigmature.
Blds by periacrsnips muist furnish the full noros of ell Farinors and rust be slpned with ths partnorship naze by
one of the membors of the partmorship or by en authorized raprosontotive, followed by the sigrature and desigz-
ration of the person signing. Bids by corporctions must be slgned with tho lezal narms of ths corporation, followod
by the nomos of ths State or States of insorporctica exnd by tha sigraturo and desicnation of the president, cecre~
tary, or othor psrson suthorized to bind it in tho mattore Ths nars of ecch person signing shall algo be typed
or printed balow the sigraturce A bid by a porson wao affixos to his slgmature the word Mpresident,™ Yagent," or
other designation without disolosinz his prin:ipal, oy be hold to the bid of ths individunl slgrings Vhen request-
ed by the Governzent, satisfacstory ovidonce of the authority of the offioer signirz in behalf of ths corporation
shall be furnizhod.

4 CCIRTCTICHS = Erasuros or othar c¢hanges in ths bids must be explainzd or noted over the sigrature of the
bidder.

5¢ TIMT FOR RECEIVIIG BIDS ~ Bids roceived prior to thoe $ime of opening will be scourely kopt, unoponed. The
officer winoco cuvy 1% 1s %0 open thom will decida yaon the speoificd tirs has arrived, and no bid rcscived thare=
aftor will ba oconsidorcde No responadibility will aticoh to an officer for tho promature opcninz of a bid not
properly sddressed and identified. Tolographle bids will not be considersd, but codifisctions by telegraph of
bids already cubmitted will be considored if resoived prior to the hour set for oponing.

6. WITHDRAVAL OF BINS - Bids =y be withZrarn on written or tolographie request recoived from bidders prior to
the tims gixed for openirge Nogligonco on tho part of tha biddspy in proparing tho bld sonfors no right for the
vithdrawl of the bid aftor 1% has beon cncnode

7 BIDDIRS PPIETIT e At tha tice fixed for tha opening of bids, thoir contents will be made publie for ths infore
ecation of bidiors ond otharg irtorosted, vwho my b prosent eithor in person or by roprescntatives

8¢ AVARD OR PRJZCTION OF BIDS = Tho award will bo mads to ths highest biddor cozplyinz with conditions of the
invizaiion ror bids, proviccd his bid is reascrable erd 4t is to tho intorsst of tho Indian ownor and ths ynited
States to mocept ite Tho bidder to whon ths arzrd is made will bo notified at tlo earliszt poszible date. The
irea Direstor, Lbowavor, resorves the right to raject any and all bids and to wive any informlity in bids received
vhenevar such rejeotion or waivor is in tha intorest of the Indian ornor or thy United Statosge.

9¢ ERRCIS IN BID -~ Blddors op their euthorized e3ents are oxpooted to examing the £aps, olroulars, schedule, and
all oticr Ingtruoiions pertelning to the invitation to bid vhich will be opon to thoip inspections They are elso
expeoted 1o make an examiration of the pro-ises to obsorwe all physical conditions, spparont encunbrances, 8coens,
etoe PFallure to do 8o will bo at the biddor's owa risk, and ho cannot ssoura rolief on tho plea of error in the
bid or in his urderstanding of the olrcusstansose

I0. Governzont appraisala of thy horcin doscribed property will not be rade available to ths genoral public,

II. The land horein edvortised for cele will be sold subjoet to exdoting loaces of resord with the Bureau of
Indlan Affairse Rents for tho comirost ycar in vwaich the cale is sompleted will be apportiornsd botwoen the soller
end the purchager as of tts dats of cpproval and dolivory of a dood or issuance of a foo potonts In the event
authorized advance rentel pavccnts, bayord the eontrast year in vhalch ths gnle is oorpleted by tha epproval and
delivery of & decd or issuarse of a feo patent, have boen sollected by the Indian owzsr, such amounts will bg
deduoted from tho purckaso pricos

12. Oocupansy of lands purchaced which 1ie vithir decignatod range units will bo transferred 0 the purchaser at
the erd of the pay poriocd following delivery of en approved deed or ingsucnse of a fes patonte Grazing feos for
the perzit pay poriod during vhich a sale is comploted by the approval and dolivery of a decd or issusnce of a

foe patent will ba apporticncd in the sare mannar as rontals,

13. then the Irdicn land offerad for sclo is irrigeble under a Foderal Irrisetion Projoct and the land hag beon
designated as boing part of a projoct, thore oxists, in acoordanse with existing laws, a licn on the land for the
paymont of unpald construction cosize The purckaser, 1f othor than an Indlen, will be roquirod to enter into a
contreot for ths peyment of such oharzes ard oosis on a per ascro tosise The conireot will provide for anmual
payment of these chargos on e dus dato of coch yeare Any or all delirjuont operation and maintenznse charges are
to be deduoted from the procecds of tha calee
14. 1iinerals, insluding oil and gas, ars to be gold with the land advertised unless reserved as indioated on the
attacked Schedules

15. Tho lands listed herein are to be zold, subfeot to ell velid exisliirg eagemonts and rights of way.
16. Title to land sold as a result of this advertisersnt will be sonveyed in & foo sicple status by either patent
in fee or approved deed, except as may ba othorwise notod.

17, Purcuant to0 tho provisions of Seotion 121.14, Title 25 cods of FPederal Rogulations, tracts of land advertised
for sale in this advertisozint, on vhich the tribe has unzuooeccsfully sought a preferonce to most the high big,
cay be subjeot to oral bidding follouinz the oponing of scaled bidse The tracts which my be subject to oral
bidding have beon identifiod in tha attached sschedule of lands to be sold by the stetement: "This may be subject
to oral bldding in ecoordance wita the Terma erd Conditions of the Invitation for Bidoe" The trasts of lend so
identified will be subject to oral biddirng following ths opaning of the gealed bids only if the followinz conditions

prevail:

(a) One or more accoptable bids kave boon submitted on the tmact.
(b) 4 sccled bid other then the high bid has beon subaltied on tho
trast by the Triboe

Upon oponing of the sealed bids, cald bids will be totulcted and the Suporintordent or his duly euthorized ropre-
sentetlve will determino these troots which will be offercd for oral biddinze He will publicly announcs by iten
muzhor those tracts thich will be so offurod ard will also anmounse tho nares of the bidders vho cro olizible to
participate in tho oral biddinz on oczch trcote Tha oral bidding may be hold immediately after the opaning of the
secled bids, or it muy be continued to cnothar dato and tims to be announsed. Bidderz in the oral auction will be
limited on ecch tract to thoze who subnit scaled bids thereon walch oqual or excocd 75 percent of tho eppreiscd
value of tho traot, and to tho Triks. In order to qualify and perticipate in the oral
blddirg, the biddor must be procernt in porson or by ropresontative under writton suthorization. At the cornslusion
of tho oral biddinz, the hir:oot biddor will be requirod to inoreaso the amount of his doposit to not less than
10 persent of ths acount bid,
18. WARND!G 70 ALL BIDDIRS - All bidders are warned against violation of 18 U.S.C, 1860, prohibiting unlawful
combination or imtimidatlion of bidders.

INTERIOR - RORTL 4NN OREGOM



REVERSE OF FORM 5-114 INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
JANUARY 1960 TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE INVITATION FOR BIDS

NOTE: This sale is also subject to the following terms and conditions:

Successful bidders are required to bear the expense of revenue stamps
and recording fees for legal documents required in the chain of title.

If title is to be conveyed to a party or parties other .than that shown
as the bidder, please make full notation on the bid.

Bids on more than one item may be made on this form, however, the
specific amount of bid on EACH ITEM must be shown and a SEPARATE
CHECK for the 10% deposit must be included for EACH ITEM.

No bid for less than the appraised value of the land will be considered.
Deposits of unsuccessful bidders will be immediately returned to them
upon receipting for same.

Each tract is sold subject to existing easements for rights of way, and/
or other legal instruments of record. (In some instances specific
right of way arrangements may be required for proper access)

Bidders should inspect the advertised items as to access, type and
character of land as well as timber volumes and species as they are not
guaranteed. Covering leases should also be examined as to terms,
restrictions, etc.

Bidders are advised that personal checks WILL NOT be accepted. As
stated on the face of this invitation, all monies submitted with bids
or as payment for balance of consideration and sales fees MUST BE

by Cashier's Check, Certified Check, Postal Money Order or United
States Treasurer's Check, made payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

The Department does not regard a sale as having been made or consum-
mated until actual delivery of the deed to the purchaser or issuance
of the patent in fee simple.

fl Pz . Vo /&/f/// A Ve

/éa/” Melvin L. Robertson, Superintendent
! Yakima Indian Agency
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' SCHEDULE OF LANDS TO BE SOLD
(Attachment to Form 5-114)

Hay 1955

Item Allotment
No. No,

1., 'Van, 158

2, Van, 189

3. Van., 168

Land Description and Information

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T, 2 N., R, 14 E,, V.M, , VASH,

TULAGUS, DEC. Ei4SEY Sec. 11, 80 acres, more or less, éx-
cepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and gas, but
excluding sand and gravel, together with the right to
prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approx., 2 miles west of Vishram Heights via U, S, Highway
830 and 250 yds. north of highway, Access from U, S. Hwy
830 subject to proper - arrangements with adjoining property
owner, All grazing land, Partially fenced. No available
livestock water on this tract, Subject to Lease No., 05023

expiring 2/28/65 which may be cancelled under specified
terms,

BILLY TELASET, DEC. VH4NWI4 Sec. 13 (LESS that portion
described as all that part lying southerly of the south
boundary of the existing right of way of the Spokane,
Portland & Seattle Rrilway Co., cont., 1.62 acres, more

or less, béirg Tract No, D-402 specified in Judgment, Civil
No. 1094, in the District Court of the U, S. for the
Eastern District of llash., taken for public use), contain-
ing a net acreage of 78.38 acres, excepting 100% of all
minerals, including oil and gas, but excluding sand and
gravel, together with the right to prospect for, mine and
remove same, reserved by sellers. Approx. 1-3/4 miles

west of lishram Heights via State Highway 830 which bisects
northerly portion of this property. Best use of the property.
is for grazing. Mo available livestock water on this tract,
Partially fenced. Subject to non-cancellable Lease No,
05441 which expires 2/28/66, Subject to perpetual use of
existing Indian cemetery (1 grave) located in approximate
center of NW4SW4 with access thereto from Hwy, 830,
Cemeteries are protected from desecration by ° State law,

T, 2 N.,, R, 15 E., W.M,, VASH,

MINCEAS, DEC. SW/NWY, and NWYSI# Sec. 11, 80 acres, more

or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil
and gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with

the right to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved
by sellers. Approx. 1-3/4 miles west of Maryhill Museum
and 1/4 to 1/2 mile north of U,S. Highway 830. No public
access, Subject to proper access arrangements from U.S,
Highway 830 through adjoining lands. All grazing. Unfenced,
Dependent upon adjoining land for livestock water. " This
tract and Van. 169 (below) are under one Lease No. 2636
expiring 2/28/69 which may be cancelled under specified
terms, Sale of either or both subject to said lease,
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DEPARTMENT OF THE-INTERIOR 6 Pages

BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS

SCHEDULE OF LANDS TO BE SOLD
(fttachment to Form 5-114)

Item Allotment
No, No.

Land Description and Information

’ 4., Van, 169

5. Van., 170

6. Van, 172

7. Van, 16

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T.2 N., R. 15 E., V.M., WASH,

LOUIE YOK, :DEC. NANWY Sec, 11, 80 acres, more or less,
excepting:-100% of all minerals, including oil and gas,
but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right

to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approximately 1-1/2 miles west of Maryhill Museum and 3/4
to 1 mile north of U,S, Highway 830. No access road to
allotment, Subject to proper access arrangements from
U.S. Hwy, 830 through adjoining lands., All grazing.
Unfenced. Dependent upon adjoining lands for livestock
water., This tuact and Van, 168 (above) are under one
Lease No. 2636 which expires 2/28/69 and may be cancelled
under specified terms. Sale of either or both subject to
said lease,

CUIASKIN, DEC. MN4SEY Sec. 2, 80 acres, more or less,
excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and gas,

but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right

to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers.
Approx. 1-i/4 to 1-1/2 miles northwest of Maryhill Museum
and 3/4 milc to 1 mile north of U,S, Hwy, 830. No public ~
access. Subject to proper access arrangements from U.S.
Hwy, 830 through adjoining lands, All grazing. Unfenced,
Dependent upca adjoining lards for livestock water. Subject
to Lease No. 2637 expiring 2/28/69 which may be cancelled
under specified terms. PAny cross fences placed by lessee
may be removed by the lessee within 30 days after termi-
nation of occupancy.

TUSACCULLAS, DRC. S4SEY4 Sec. 2, 80 acres, more or less,
excepiing 10C% of all minerals, including 6il and gas, but
excluding ¢ .d and gravel, together with the right to
prospect for, mine and, remove same, reserved by sellers.
Epprox. 1 mile west of Maryhill Museum and 1/2 to 3/4 mile
north of U, S, Hwy. 830, No public access to property.
Subject to access arrangements over adjoining lands. All
grazing., Unfenced. Dependent upon adjoining lands for
livestock water, No structural improvements., Sale of this
tract is subject to Lease No. 2639 expiring 2/28/69 which
may be cancelled under specified terms,

SKAMANTIA COUNTY

T. 3 N., R. 10 E,, W.M,, VASH,

GRACTE SLOUTIE, DEC. SW4NW4 Sec., 3, 40 acres, more or less,
excepting 100% of all minerals, including eil and gas, but
excluding sand and gravel, together with the right to pros-
pect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers. Approx.
8 miles northwest of White Salmon, 'ash,, (west of Vhite
Salmon River) via paved State Hwy.gfl, an improved gravel
road and unimproved dirt road which bisects northerly
portion of property, and for which there is no right of

way of record, provides access, Subject %o prop-v

access ar-argements over adjoining 1a-ds, Two
small intermittent streams cross the property. Unienced.

No structural improvements, The land is primarily timbered
with stands of Douglas fir 483,000 bd.ft., white fir 28,000
bd. ft., and western redcedar 4,000 bd.ft. The above quoted
figures are not guaranteed. Property is not under lease at
this time.

—— e R E————
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SCHEDULE OF LANDS TO BE SOLD
(Attachment to Form 5-114)

Item Allotment
No. No.

Land Descripticn and Information

8. Van. Hstd. 832

9. Van. 47

KLICKITAT COUNTY

I. 4N., R. 10E., W.M., TiASH,

JOHN QUAEMPTS, DEC. SE%Sec. 35 (LESS a portion described
as: Beginning at an iron pipe located in the scuthern boun-
dary of Sec. 35, T. 4 N., R. 10 E., W.M., 648 ft., east of
the 1/4 corner between Sec. 2, T. 3 N., R, 10 E., and Sec.
35, T. 4 N., R. 10 E., th., N 9°35' E., 483.1 ft., to a
point; th., N 25922 E., 322.1 ft., to a point; th.,

N 16%3' E., 632.7 ft., to a point in the north boundary
of the SW%SEY Sec. 35, T. 4 N., R. 10 E., W.M., th.,

N 88°13' E., 121.5 ft., along the north boundary of said
SWESE% Sec. 35, to a point, th., § 13°12' W., 702.%4 ft.,

to a point; th., 5 2595' W., 349.7 ft., to a point;

th., § 1°45' E., 371.7 ft., m/1., to a point in the
southern boundary of said SW%SE% Sec. 35; th., S 89°13' wW.,
221.2 ft., along the southern boundary of said tract to

the pt., 'of beginning and containing 5 acres, m/1, con-
veyed to Northwestern Electric Co., 12/19/13). containing
a net acreage of 155 acres, more or less, excepting 50%

of all minerals, including oil and gas, but excludingsand
and gravel, together with the right to prospect for, mine
and remove same, reserved by sellers. Approx. 1-1/4 mi.,
southwest of Husum on paved black-top White Salmon-Trout

. Lake Highway. No #irect public ‘access to rroperty. Subject
‘ to proper access arrangements over adjoining lands from
. highway. White Salmon River bisects the property. This

land is timbered with stands of ponderosa pine 1,770 bd.ft.,
Douglas fir 1,199,320 bd.ft., western redcedar 5,390 bd.ft.,

. white fir 59,390 bd.ft., and western hemlocih 5.250 td.ft.

Above quoted figures are not guaranteed. Preperzy is not
under lease at this time. Twenty acres izrigeble for which
yearly assessment levied by White Salmon Irrigation District,

IInc.

T. 4 N.. R. 11 E., W.M., WASH.

MELY CAYUSE, DEC. EANEL Sec. 20 and NWiINWHNWYL, SLINWLNWY,

SWENWY, Sec. 21, 150 acres, more or less, excepting 100%
of all minerals, including o0il and gas, but excluding sand
and gravel,. together with the right to prospect for, mine
and remove same, reserved by sellers. Approx. 2 miles
northeast of Husum, Wash., by graveled road known as
Rattlesnake Road which bisects the property south to
north. Rattlesnake Creek crosses the southeas: co ner

of this land. This land is classed primarily as timbered
with stands of ponderosa pine 100,110 bd.ft., Douglas

fir 1,167,280 bd.ft., and white fir 58,090 bc.ft. Above
quoted figures are not guaranteed. Property is rot under
lease at this time.
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SCHEDULE OF LANDS TO BF. SOLD
(Attachment to Form 5-114)

ITEM Allotment
No. -No.

Land Description and Information

10, Van,Hstd, 408

An undivided
26117/26460
interest.

-

11, Van, Hstd.303

12, W, W.31

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T, 4N., R, 11 E., V.M., WASH,

CHARLES WANACHPA, DEC. NFY% Sec. 18, 160 acres, more or
less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and
gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right
to prosnect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers.
Approx. 2 miles north of Husum, Wash., on graveled road,

on east side of White Salmén River. No public access to
property. Subject to proper access arrangementis over
adjoeining lands., This land is timbered with stands of
ponderosa pine 299,200 bd.ft,, Douglas fir 3,395,200 bd,
ft., and white fir 96,000 bd.ft. The above quoted figures
are not guaranteed. This property is not under iease at
this time. Successful bidder will need to negotiate with
non-Indian owners for purchase of their undivided interests
343/26460 in this tract, An undivided 26117/26460 trust
interest is being offered for sale on this Invitation.

I, 4 N., R, 13 E., WM., WASH.

BILL, CHARLEY, DEC. S¥NEY4 and NBSEY Sec. 26, 160 acres, more
or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and
gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right
to prospect for, mine and remove same, reseirved by sellers.
Approx. 1 mile southeast of Klickitat, Wash.. however,
there is no public access to the property. Subject to
proper access arrangements over adjoining lands. The

land is classed as dry farming and grazing. An intermittent
stream provides water until summer months, otherwise
dependent upon adjoining lands for livestock water. Par-
tially fenced, No structural improvements. Subject to
non-cancellable Lease No. 1715 expiring 2/28/67.

T. 4N., R, 23 E,, WM., WASH.

CHEWITH (TSAWACK PLBERT), DEC. SE4 Sec. 7, 160 acres,
more or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including
oil and gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with
the right to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved
by sellers, Approximately 2 miles west of Aldercale and
1/2 mile north of highway, Access via farm road starting
2 miles north of £lderdale and proceeding west and south
1-1/4 miles and then southwest for 1-3/4 miles. No formal
right of way of record. No public access to property,
Subject to proper access arrangements over adicining lands,
A11 grazing land. Fenced on south and west boundaries,
Dependent upon adjoining lands for livestock waier, No
structural improvements, This tract subjesi to ron-can-
cellable Lease No, 1524 expiring 2/28/67. Sale of this
tract -subject to said lease.
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Item Allotment
No. No,

Land Description and Information

13. Van,.132

15. Yak., 305

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T, SN., R. 19 E,, W.M,, WASH,

- TOVMOWLOWLIL, DEC, Lots 1 and 2 and EMNWY. Sec. 31, 156,65

acres, more or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, in-
cluding oil and gas, but excluding. sand and gravel, to-
gether with the right to prospect for, mine .and remove
same, reserved by sellers. Approximately 6 miles south-
west of Cleveland, Hash.,, and 8-1/2 miles.north of Goodnoe
Hills. Access per farm road, leaving Cleveland, Rock Creek
Road and proceeding south, No public access to this
property. Subject. to proper access arrangements over
adjoining lands. £11 Grazing land. Unfenced. Harrison
Creek bisects the southeastern portion of the property,
along northern and western slope of Harrison Creek are
several undeveloped springs which appear to furnish
sufficient water for livestock during periods of normal
precipitation. No-struct@fal improvements. Subject to
non-cancellable Lease No, 05241 expiring 2/28/65.

I, 5N., R, 23 E,, UI.M,, VASH,

MYUTE (BILLIE) DEC. S Sec. 34, 160 acres, more or less,. .
excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and gas,

but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right

to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approximately 2-1/4 miles north of Alderdale on graveled
county road (No.509, Six-Prong-Alder Creek) which bisects
the .property. No right of way of record. Best use as
gr321ng Six-Prong and Alder Creeks traverse southern
portion of property. This tract subject to non-cancellable
Lease No, 1524 exp1r1ng 2/28/67. Sale of this tract subject
to said lease. R

YAKIMA COUNTY

‘T. 10 N, R, 20 Eu W M.,_WASH

.t

HENRY CHARLEY, DEC. NE4SW; and E;gmwsw and E%W/NWVSNV ]
Sec. 22, 70 acres, more or less, ~excépting 100% of all
m1nera1s, 1nclud1ng oil and gas,_bup excluding sand and
gravel, together with the right to prospect for, mine
and remove same, reserved, by sellers.  Approximately 2
miles south of Toppenish, . Ihsh., on Primary State Bwy.-
8 and 1/4 mile east on Ford. Rd,. for which there is no
formal right of way of record. . The land is pasture,

No water is presently avallable to the property. Fenced,
Subject to Lease No, 2494 which expires 2/28/69 and may
be cancelled under specifred terms.

— e e B i - e
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Item Allotment
No, No, Land Description and Information
YAKIMA COUNTY
T, 13 N.., R, 17 E., W.M,, WASH.
16, Cowiche SALOOSKIN, JEC, NEYSEY Sec. 4, 40 acres, more or less,
Homestead -

excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and gas, but
excluding sand and gravel, together with the right to pros-
pect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers.
Approximately 3 miles south of Cowiche, VWash, Access is

by county paved and graveled roads. Pioneer Way Rd. .
bisects the southwesterly portion of this property. Best
use .is for irrigated crop production and potential orchard
production, Partially fenced, A one-story frame building,
in poor condition, is located en the property. . Property
has a court adjudicated water right for-eight:acres:of
Class 6C water from Cowiche Creek, Subject to Lease No.
2721 expiring 2/ 28/67 which may be cancelled under
specified ;terms.  Subject to perpetual use of existing
Indian -cemetery, with access thereto (approx 1/4 acre)
located in center of 'allotment. Cemeteries are protected
from desecration by:- State law, Bidders should examine
County records and confirm court adjudicated water right.
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UNITED-STATES
FORM 5-114 DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

ISSUEDBY: Superintendent * INVITATION NO..1=64..... BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED
Yakfma Indian Agency  UNTIL AND OPENED AT.......2.200...0.yMy...... LOCAL TIME
Toppenish, Washington ! DATE.ADEAL..Zy 1964  AT...Yakima

DATE: March 4, 1964 {Indian Agency,. = i

O T T o e e o B e o o o e e o S e o = B = = ® @ o o = B e e T e e a4 e % e e s " e S e P e e e T T A % B D e e 40 e > e

Sealed bids in duplicate, subject to the terms and conditions of this invitation, its schedule and stipulated provisions, will be received
at the above office until above designated time and at that time publicly opened. All bids are subject to acceptance and approval by the
Area Director. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to disapprove any transaction at any time prior to final approval of a
deed or issuance of a fee patent, in accordance with 25 CFR 121. Bids on Indian land offered for sale must be accompanied by a cashier's

check, certified check, postal money order, or United States Treasurer’s check payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs for not less than
10% of the total offer made.

General information and instructions to bidders are contgined in the Instructions to Bidders, Terms and Conditions of the Invitation for

.................................................................................................... Lrosrensrssromirososnannsti™® i
P..0..Box.632,.Toppenish,.Washington » Phone No..T()..5=6505
SCHEDULE OF BIDS
--------- X .-------.-----------------.----'---..------------------....-_..----------------------------o’“omm-—----
ftem ! Allotment No. of i Amountof | Item Allotment No. of i Amount of
No. Number Acres Bid ¢ No Number Acres _ _ Bd

ecenbomnsedeannsanrcnticanncaacem

DR R R R Rt R e L R e T I T

The undersigned agrees that if the amount offered for any item or items in the above be accepted, he will within 30 calendar days
from date of receipt of notice of award deposit with the issuing officer, Bureau of Indian Affairs, the full amount of his offer, with stipulated

sale;‘s fees, and that failure to make such deposit within the specified time will constitute a forfeiture of 10% of the amount offered on each
such item.

;

[ ]

1]

E Signature of Bidder

:

L]

E Name of Bidder (Print or Type)

:

' Address (Print or Type)

1]

""""""'"'""""'"'"""'_"Kxb%'xéi:'éﬁXva’"ib'éﬁé&::sé'sfix}iéﬁiééﬁ" """"""""""""""""""""

You are hereby notified that you are the successful'bidder on the following items:
Balance of the purchase price in the amount of $ shall be remitted to the above

issuing office not later than:

Date

REMITTANCE SHOULD BE MADE
BY CASHIER'S CHECK, CERTI-
FIED CHECK, POSTAL MONEY
ORDER, OR UNITED STATES
TREASURER'S CHECK , made Area Director

payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

£

i A o e g
"SALES FEES ARE AS FOLLOWS:

TRIBAL PURCHASE PRICE
420,00 $1000 or less
25.00 1660 to 2000
30.00 2000 to 3000
40,00 3000 t» 4000
50.00 4000 to 5000
65.00 5000 to 7500
75.00 7500 and over

(NTERIOR  PORTL ANT DREGAN
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REVERSE OF FORM! 5=114 INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDZRS
JANUARY 1960 TERMS AND CCNDITICNS OF THE INVITATION FCR BIDS

I. )ARKING AlD MAILING BILS « Lido, with tholp gusrentics, mist bs sccurely scaled in suitable envelopes, ad-
dreesed vo the issuirg office and marked on tho outside with the invitotlon nuzber and date of opening, both of
vhich may bo found in the block opposite the rems of the issuing office on the front of this form.

2. PROPAMATICH OF BIDS = Unless othorwliso directed in the invitotion, bids shall boe submitied in duplicates
Porns furnlshod, or copies thoreof, ghall be uscd, and sirlet compliznoe vith tho requirczsnts of tha invitations,
and thezo instructions, is nscoszarys Spesiel caro chould be oxoreiccd in ths preparation and cubaission of bids
to ascure full compliance with tho invitotion arnd instructicnsz. All itoem ru=bors ard prices ghall be fully ard
olearly sot forthe Coples of the bid shall be ldenticals Tko proper blank cpaces in the bid shall be suitcbly
filled in,
3¢ SIGHATUTS 7O BIDS - Eaoh bid rmust give addross of thas biddor and bo gigned by hin with his usual signatura.
Blds by parinsrsrips mist furnish the full noros of ell parinors arnd rust bo signed with ths partnorship name by
one of the membors of the partrnorship or by en suthorized représontative, followed by the sigrature and desig-
ration of ths person signing. Bids by corporations must be signoed with tho legel nams of tha corporation, followod
by the nomss of the State or States of imsorporctica exd by ths sigrnaturo end designation of the president, zecre~
tary, or othor person authorized to bird it in tho m=xiters Ths nargy of ecch person slgninz shall algo be typed
or primted balow the sigratiroe A bld by a porcon wao affixes to his sigrmature the word Mpresident," Hagent,” or
othor designation without disoloaing his prinsipal, eny be hold to tho bid of tha individual sigringe. Vhen roquest-
ed by the Govornzont, satisfastory ovidonce of tho authority of the oificer signiry in behalf of ths corporation
shall be furnichod,

4. CCERTCTICHS = Erasuros or othor chonges in the bida mist be explained or noted over the sigrature of the
biddcl‘o

5. TDE FOR RECEIVIIG BIDS - Bido rooceived prior to the time of openinz will be scoursly kupt, unopernede The
officer wiicca cuvy 1t 1s {0 opon thim will decids ¥ion the speoificd tims has arrived, and no bid rcscived thare=
after will bo considored. No respoasibility will aticsh to an officer for tho promaturc oponinz of a bid not
properly addrosced end identifiede fTolegcrapide bids will not be considersd, but codifications by telograph of
bids already submitted will be considored if resoived prior to the hour set for oponing.

6. CWITHDRAVAL OF BINS - Bids r—y be withdravn on written or tolograpilc request rocolved from bidders prior to
the time tixcd for openinge Nogligonco on tia part of tha biddar in proparing the bid sonfors no right for the
withdrawml of the bid aftoer 1% has beon cncnode

7. BIDDIRS PPIEDIT » At tha time fixed for tha opening of bids, thair contents will be made public for the infor—
ration of bidiors and othars irtorosted, who may be prssent eitllor in porson or by ropresentativoe.

8. AVARD OR RRJECTION OF BIDS = Tho award will bo mxde to the highest biddor coxplyinz with conditions of the
invization ror bids, provicca his bid is reascnable erd it is to tha intorost of ths Indian owmor and ths United
States to cscept ite Tho bidder to whon the avard is made will be notified at ths earliect possible datee The
drea Director, Lowover, resorves the right to rajoct any and all bids and to wivo any informality in bids received
vhanevar such rejection or waivor is in the intorest of tho Indian ornor or ths United Statose

9o ERRCIS IN BID =~ Elddors or their euthorized cgenis aro erpooted to examins ths maps, oirsculars, gschedule, and
all oificr lnosruosions perteining to ths invitatioa to bid vhich will be opon to tholr incpection, 7Thzy are also
expeoted 10 make en examiration of the proxzises to obcorvo all physical conditions, epparont encunbranses, access,
etce Falluro to do so will bo at tho biddor's owa risk, and ho cannot scours rolief on tho plea of error in the
bid or in his urnderstanding of the oircuzstancose

I0. Governzont oppralcalas of tho horoin doscribed property will not be rade available to ths general public.

II, The land herein advertiscd for cele will bo 501ld subjost to e:dstinz loases of record with the Bureau of
Indian Affairse Rents for tho conirest ycar in viilch ¢the cale is comploted will bo apportionsd botwoen the seller
and the purchacer as of the dats of cpproval and dolivory of a dood or issuance of & fco patonte In the event
euthorized advance rental payvicnts, beyord tho contraot year in which ths sale is corpleted by tho epproval and
delivery of a decd or issusrse of a fee patent, have boen collected by the Irdlan owzer, such amounts will be
deduoted from the purchase pricoe

12. Ooscupancy of lands purchased which 1ie withirn descignated range units will be transferred to the purchaser at
the ernd of the pay poriocd following delivery of en approved deod or igsusnece of a fee patonte Grazing fecs for
the perzmit pay poriod during vhich a sale is comploted by tho approval and delivery of e decd or issuance of a

feo patent will be apporticzed in the same canmor as rontals,

13. vthen the Indirn land offerad for sole is lrrigeble under a Foderal Irrigaiion Projoct and ths land has been
deslgnated as boing part of a projoct, thore exicts, in acoordarse with existing laws, a licn on ths land for the
payment of unpaid oconsirustion costse The purckaser, if othor thon en Indien, will be roquired to enter into a
contreot for ths payment of such oharzes arnd costs on a per sore basise The sontreot will provide for annual
payment of these chargoes on a cue dato of coch yoare Any or all delirquort operation and rmaintemanse oharges are
to be deduoted from the procecds of tho salo.

14. uinerels, including oil and gas, are to be sold with the land advertised unless reserved as indicated on the
attashed Schedule,

15. Tko lands 1listed herein are to be cold, subjfeot to ell velid existirg easemonts and rights of way.
16. Title to land sold as a result of this advertisemont will be oonveyed in a foe sicple status by either patent
in fee or approved deed, except &3 may ba olhorwise noted.

17. Purcuant to tho provisions of Section 121.14, Title 25 Codo of Federal Rogulstions, traots of lard advertised
for sale in this adveritisez:unt, on vhich the tribe has unsuccecssfully sought a proferonce to most ths high bid,
zay be subjeot to orael bidding following the oponing of scaled bidse The trasts which my be subject to orel
bidding have beon identified in tha ettached schedule of lands to be sold by the stetemeat: "This =y bs subjeot
to oral bilddinz in escordance with tho Terma erd Conditions of the Invitation for Bidse" The trasts of land so
identified will be subject to oral biddirg following ths oponing of the sealed bids only if tha follewirz conditions

grevail:

(a) One or more ascoptable bids kave boon submitted on the tract.
(b) A socled bid other then the high bid hos beon subnitied on ths
trast by the Tribae
Upon oponing of the sealod bids, gald blds will be tatuleted and tho Suporintondent or his duly euthorized ropre-
sentetive will determiro those trests which will be offered for oral biddinz. He will publiocly annourss by iten
muzbor those troots which will be so offorcd ard will also announce tho names of tho bidders who aro oligible to
participato in tho oral bidding on ozch troote The oral bidding mey be held immcdiately after tho opening of the
sealcd bids, or it msy be oontinusd to enothsr date end tims to be announsed. Biddes:z in the orel auction will be
limited on ecch irast to thoze who subnit ceoled blds theroon which oqual or excocd 75 percont of tho apprelsod
valus of ths tract, and to tho Trikse In order to qualify arnd participate in tho orel
blddirg, the bidder must be procent in porson Or by rcpresontative under writiton authorizatione At the sorclusion
of tho oral biddinz, the hishost biddor will be required to inoreasoe tho amount of his deposit to not less than
10 percont of ths acount bid,

18. WARNT!D TO ALL BIDDIDS - All bidders are warned ageinst violation of 18 U.S.Ce 1860, prohibiting unlawful
cozmbination or intimidation of bidders.

INTERIOR  BORTLAND. OREGON
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NOTE:

This sale is also subject to the following terms and conditions:

Successful bidders are required to bear the expense of revenue stamps
and recording fees for legal documents required in the chain of title.

If title is to be conveyed to a party or parties other .than that shown
as the bidder, please make full notation on the bid.

Bids on more than one item may be made on this form, however, the
specific amount of bid on EACH ITEM must be shown and a SEPARATE
CHECK for the 107% deposit must be included for EACH ITEM.

No bid for less than the appraised value of the land will be considered.
Deposits of unsuccessful bidders will be immediately returned to them
upon receipting for same.

Each tract is sold subject to existing easements for rights of way, and/
or other legal instruments of record. (In some instances specific
right of way arrangements may be required for proper access)

Bidders should inspect the advertised items as to access, type and
character of land as well as timber volumes and species as they are not
guaranteed. Covering leases should also be examined as to terms,
restrictions, etc.

Bidders are advised that personal checks WILL NOT be accepted. As
stated on the face of this invitation, all monies submitted with bids
or as payment for balance of consideration and sales fees MUST BE

by Cashier's Check, Certified Check, Postal Money Order or United
States Treasurer's Check, made payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

The Department does not regard a sale as having been made or consum-
mated until actual delivery of the deed to the purchaser or issuance
of the patent in fee simple.

,,;" Melvin L. Robertson, Superintendent
Yakima Indian Agency




REVERSE OF FORM 5-114 INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS
JANUARY 1960 TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE INVITATION FOR BIDS

NOTE:

This sale is also subject to the following terms and conditions:

Successful bidders are required to bear the expense of revenue stamps
and recording fees for legal documents required in the chain of title.

If title is to be conveyed to a party or parties other .than that shown
as the bidder, please make full notation on the bid.

Bids on more than one item may be made on this form, however, the
specific amount of bid on EACH ITEM must be shown and a SEPARATE
CHECK for the 10% deposit must be included for EACH ITEM.

No bid for less than the appraised value of the land will be considered.
Deposits of unsuccessful bidders will be immediately returned to them
upon receipting for same.

Each tract is sold subject to existing easements for rights of way, and/
or other legal instruments of record. (In some instances specific
right of way arrangements may be required for proper access)

Bidders should inspect the advertised items as to access, type and
character of land as well as timber volumes and species as they are not
guaranteed. Covering leases should also be examined as to terms,
restrictions, etc.

Bidders are advised that personal checks WILL NOT be accepted. As
stated on the face of this invitation, all monies submitted with bids
or as payment for balance of consideration and sales fees MUST BE

by Cashier's Check, Certified Check, Postal Money Order or United
States Treasurer's Check, made payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

The Department does not regard a sale as having been made or consum-
mated until actual delivery of the deed to the purchaser or issuance
of the patent in fee simple.

,,,/' Melvin L. Robertson, Superintendent
Yakima Indian Agency
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ITEM Allotment
No. No. Land Description and Information

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T. 4N., R._11 E_ . WM., WASH,

10, Van,Hstd, 408 CHARLES WANACHPA, DEC. NE4 Sec¢. 18, 160 acres, more or
less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and

An undivided gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right
26117/26460 to prosnect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
interest. Approx. 2 miles north of Husum, Wash., on graveled road,

. on east side of White Salmén River. No public dccess to
property. Subject to proper access arrangements over
~adjoining lands, This land is timbered with stands of
“ponderosa pine 299,200 bd.ft., Douglas fir 3,395,200 bd.
ft., and white fir 96,000 bd,ft. The above quoted figures
aré not guaranteed. This property is not under lease at
this time. Successful bidder will need to negctiate with
non-Indian owners for purchase of their undivided interests
343/26460 in this tract. An undivided 26117/26460 trust
interest is being offered for sale on this Invitation.

. . . T. 4N., R, 13 E., W.M,, WASH.

11. Van,Hstd.303 BILL CHARLEY, DEC. S4NEY and N/4SE} Sec. 26, 150 asres, more
or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and
gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right
to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approx. 1 mile southeast of Klickitat, Wash,, however,
there is no public access to the property. Subject to
proper access arrangements over adjoining lands. The
land is classed as dry farming and grazing. An intermittent
stream provides water until summer months, othsrwise
dependent upon adjoining lands for livestock water., Par-
tially fenced. No structural improvements. Subject to
non-cancellable Lease No, 1715 expiring 2/28/67.

T. 4 N., R. 23 E., W.M., WASH,

12, W, W.31 CHEWITH (TSAWACK FLBERT), DEC. SE¥% Sec. 7, 160 acres,
more or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, including
oil and gas, but excluding sand and gravel, together with
the right to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved
by sellers. Approximately 2 miles west of Aiderdale and
1/2 mile north of highway., Access via farm road starting
2 miles north of £Alderdale and proceeding west and south
1-1/4 miles and then southwest for 1-3/4 miles. No formal
right of way of record. No public access to pregerty,
Subject to proper access arrangements over adjoining lands,
A1l grazing land. Fenced on south and west bcundaries,
Dependent upon adjoining lands for livestock waicr, No
structural improvements. This tract subjec: to non-can-
cellable Lease No, 1524 expiring 2/28/67. Sale of this
tract subject to said lease,

figures are not guaranteed. PIODEYTY IS not-unuer-rease—av .

this time.
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SCEEDULE OF LAMNBS TG BE SOLD
(Attachment to Form 5-114)

Allotment
No,

Item
No.,

Land Description and Information

13. Van, .132

14, WU, 27

15, Yak, 3034

E——————————

KLICKITAT COUNTY

T. SN., R. 19 E,, WM, WASH,

~ TORMOWLOWLIL, DEC.

Lots 1 and 2 and EMNWZ Sec.. 31, 156,65

acres, more or less, excepting 100% of all minerals, in-

cluding oil and gas, but excluding. sand and gravel, to-
gether with the right to prospect for, mine.and remove
same, reserved by sellers,

Approximately 6 miles South-

west of Cleveland, Wash., and 8-1/2 miles.north of Goodnoe

Hills.
Road and procecding south. No public access to this
property. Subject. to proper access arrangements over
adjoining 1lands. 211 Grazing land,
Creek bisects the southeastern portion of the property,
along northern and western slope of Harrison Creek are
several undeveloped springs which- appear to furnish
sufficient water for livestock during periods of normal
precipitation. No-struct@®fal improvements. Subject to
non-cancellable Lease No. 05241 expiring 2/28/65.

I, SN., R, 23 E,, .M, VIASH,

MYUTE (BILLIE) DEC.
excepting 100% of all minerals, including oil and gas,
but excluding sand and gravel, together with the right

Access per farm road, leaving Cleveland, Rock Creek

Unfenced. Harrison

o Sec. 34, 160 acres, more or less,. .

to prospect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approximately 2-1/4 miles north of Alderdale on graveled
county road (No,.509, Six-Prong-flder Creek) which bisects

the property. No right of way of record. Best use as
grazing, Six-Prong and Alder Creeks traverse southern
portion of property.

This tract subject to non-cancellable

Lease No, 1524 expiring 2/28/67. Sale of this tract subject

to said lease.

YAKIMA COUNTY = n - o ieer

M., WASH,

T..10N,, R, 20 E,, W

HENRY CHARLEY, DEC. NE%4SUY and E¥NW4SWY and EXG4NWYLSWY
Sec. 22, 70 acres, more or less,. excepting 100% of all
minerals, including oil and gas, but-excluding sand and
gravel, together with .the right: to prospect for, mine
and remove same, reserved by sellers,. 'Approximately 2
miles south of Toppenish, Vlash,, on Primary State Hwy.
8 and 1/4 mile east on Ford Rd, for which there is no
formal right of way of recard. The land is pasture.

No water is presently available to the property. Fenced,
Subject to Lease No. 2494 whith expires 2/28/69 and may
be cancelled under specified terms. L

e
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Item Allotment
No, No, Land Description and Information
YAKIMA COUNTY
T, 13 N., R, 17E,, W.M,, WASH,
16, Cowiche SALOOSKIN, DEC. NEMSEY Sec. 4, 40 acres, more:or less,
Homestead -

exceptihg 100% of all minerals, including oil and-gas, but
excluding sand and gravel, together with the right to:-pros-
pect for, mine and remove same, reserved by sellers,
Approximately 3 miles south of-Cowiche, -Wash, Access is:

by county paved and graveled roads. -Pioneer Way Rd.
bisects the southwesterly portion of this property. Best
use is for irrigated crop production and potential orchard
preduction, Partially fenced., A one-story frame building,
in poor condition,; is located on the.property. Property
has a court adjudicated water right for eight acres of
Class 6C water from Cowiche Creek. Subject to Lease No.
2721 expiring 2/ 28/67 which may be cancelled under
specified terms. Subject to perpetual use of existing
Indian cemetery, with access thereto (approx 1/4 acre)
located in center of allotment. Cemeteries are protected
from desecration by - State law, Bidders should examine
County records and confirm court adjudicated water right,

P O
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ISSUED BY: Superintendent
Yaktma Indian Agency
Toppenish, Washington
DATE:

...............................................

UNITED-STATES

March 4, 1964

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR
______________________________________ Bny.ALLOF_!N DIAN AFFAIRS

A = e S e e e e e e e e e N N e e e . ... - . - - o

t INVITATION NO...1 =64 _.. BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED

UNTIL AND OPENED AT
DATE.April.Z,..1964.

2200 Pl

.

AT...Yakima

LOCAL TIME

e P e e o e o oo e e D e = e .- o= - e e

e e o e e o o e - e e o e B W . e e e Y P e e e e W D e G Y R AR e

Sealed bids in duplicate, subject to the terms and conditions of this invitation, its schedule and stipulated provisions, will be received
at the above office until above designated time and at that time publicly opened. All bids are subject to acceptance and approvat by the
Area Director. The right is reserved to reject any and all bids and to disapprove any transaction at any time prior to final approval of a
deed or issuance of a fee patent, in accordance with 25 CFR 121. Bids on Indian land offered for sale must be accompanied by a cashier’s
check, certified check, postal money order , or United States Treasurer’s check payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs for not less than
10% of the total offer made.

General information and instructions to bidders are contgined in the Instructions to Bidders, Terms and Conditions of the Invitation for

Bids, which is a part hereol. For detailed information call or write.. SUperintendent, Yakima Indian-Agerrcy.

E...0..Box.632,. . Toppeni sh,..Washington

Allotment
Number

---------------

- Phone No..T()..5=6505.
SCHEDULE OF BIDS '
B e e i P Gy g Uy L
Amountof | Item Allotment No. of Amount of
Bid ' No. Number Acres Bid
1}

recocnicarnsdavunvuassnaereniccneeocenes

---------------------------------------

The undersigned agrees that if the amount offered for any item or items in the above be accepted, he will within 30 calendar days
from date of receipt of notice of award deposit with the issuing officer, Bureau of Indian Affaits, the full amount of his

sales fees, and that {ailure to make such d

such item.

e e R & e o e o e @ ™ D = = e

-------------------------------~o-.---------_—---------------------_---_--------------------

-------------------------------------

offer, with stipulated

eposit within the specified time will constitute a forfeiture of 10% of the amount offered-on each

Signature of Bidder

Name of Bidder (Print or Type)

You are hereby notified that you are the successtul' bidder on the following iters:

Balance of the purchase price in the amount of §

issuing office not later than:

Address (Print or Type)

REMITTANCE SHOULD BE MADE
BY CASHIER'S CHECK, CERT!-
FIED CHECK, POSTAL MONEY
ORDER, OR UNITED STATES
TREASURER'S CHECK , made

payable to the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

Date

shall be remitted to the above

#

R —
“"SALES FEES ARE AS FOLLOWS:

TRIBAL

$20.00

PURCHASE

PRICE

25.00
30.00
40.00
50,00
65,00
75.00

e

$1000

1000
2000
3000
4000
5000
7500

or less
2000
3000
4000
5000
7300
and over

to
to
to
to
to

Area Director





